
 

2014 Ultra Lite Palomino Solaire Eclipse 263RBDSK
Contact: Keith  Hanson

Email: Keith@thenctech.com
https://34.67.10.103/rvscampers/2014-ultra-lite-palomino-solaire-eclipse-263rbdsk_port-angeles_296340

Address: Brooke Ave, 101, Port Angeles
Price: 19.90 $

PRICE DROP!!  Top of the line ultralight trailer for sale. Fully loaded. 2 slideouts. 20 foot
power awning replaced 1 1/2 years ago. Power everything. Since it is 10 years old, banks
will still finance. Lots of upgrades. Central ducted heat. Central ducted air conditioning, air
conditioner replaced 4 years ago. Electric fireplace with fake flames. Visio Smart TV. TV
Swivels between living area and bedroom. AMFM CD player with speakers inside and
outside. Nice deep mattress with new sheets and pillows. Lots of storage. LED lighting.
Carpet replaced. Nice refrigerator / freezer. Kenmore Pro Convection Microwave with power
vent. 2 basin kitchen sink. Corelle Countertops. Large pantry. Small table and 2 chairs.
Couch folds into bed. Nice full sized Kohler china toilet. Has extra 30 amp connector for
extra GFCI’s around trailer plus UltraHeat  heated tanks and waste pipes for cold winter
operation. Has Swivel BBQ Mount. Spare Tire. Swivel out table and refrigerator for outside
cooking. Flat Glass Windows. Linex coated front for rock protection. Power stabilizer jacks
front and rear. New sewage dump hose and clear fittings. Spare parts. Extra power cord
testing and connection stuff. 12000 Lb trailer hitch and load leveler / anti sway EZ hitch
system included. Power Front jack.  Has nice lighted basement storage area. LED accent
lights on front. Has fiberglass exterior walls. Arched roof. 2 deep cycle batteries replaced 2
months ago.  There is more stuff I sure I missed…it’s loaded. Great shape, Clean and ready
to go. Very little wear and tear. Located in Port Angeles. Call 206-818-4527
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